
$269,900 - 300 New Bethel Church Road Road, London
MLS® #25015446

$269,900
3 Bedroom, 1.00 Bathroom, 1,530 sqft
Residential on 7 Acres

Rural, London, KY

&#127806; Country Living with Room to
Roam! &#127969;
Welcome to this classic brick ranch tucked
away in rural Laurel Countyâ€”built in 1981
and sitting on a peaceful 7.11-acre tract. This
home features 3 bedrooms, 1 full bath, a cozy
living room, a functional kitchen, and an extra
bonus room just off the carportâ€”perfect for a
mudroom, home office, or hobby space.

Step outside and you'll find outdoor pens
ready for goats or hogs, plus multiple
outbuildings and a storage shedâ€”all
negotiable with purchase. Whether you're
dreaming of a mini farm, a homestead, or just
some extra elbow room, this property checks
the boxes for rural freedom without breaking
the bank.

Bonus potential: There's an unlivable mobile
home on the property that could be renovated
or removed, and space available to place up to
three additional mobile homesâ€”making it a
great fit for a multi-family setup, rental income,
or extended family living.

Don't miss your chance to make it
yoursâ€”schedule your showing today! OPEN
HOUSE: Saturday, August 9th 12 -2pm

Built in 1981

Essential Information

MLS® # 25015446



Price $269,900

Bedrooms 3

Bathrooms 1.00

Full Baths 1

Square Footage 1,530

Acres 7.11

Year Built 1981

Type Residential

Sub-Type Single Family Residence

Style Ranch

Status Active

Community Information

Address 300 New Bethel Church Road Road

Area 044 - Laurel County

Subdivision Rural

City London

County Laurel

State KY

Zip Code 40741

Amenities

Parking Driveway

View Rural, Trees

Interior

Appliances Microwave, Range, Refrigerator

Heating Electric

Cooling None

Stories One

Exterior

Lot Description Wooded

Roof Metal, Shingle

Construction Brick Veneer

Foundation Block

School Information

District Laurel County - 44



Elementary Johnson Elementary

Middle North Laurel

High North Laurel

Additional Information

Date Listed July 15th, 2025

Listing Details

Listing Office Shawn Rogers Realty, Inc
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