
$749,000 - 71 Eagle Landing Tract 9, London
MLS® #25016266

$749,000
4 Bedroom, 3.00 Bathroom, 3,474 sqft
Residential on 6 Acres

Pittsburg Landing, London, KY

Beautiful New Barndominium under
construction in Pittsburg Landing on 5.57
acres. Pittsburg Landing is London's newest
acreage development located just 3 miles from
North Laurel High School. This huge home
hosts 3474 square feet living space plus over
1900 sf garage. Room for motorhome and 2
cars and more. Garage is 50 deep by 42 wide.
This beautiful build has huge great room with
wood vaulted ceiling and propane fireplace.
Soaring ceiling 19 ft with 8 ft front door and
side door. Open floor plan includes
kitchen/dining with lots of beautiful off white
cabinetry, island bar with granite countertops
and coffee bar. Home has 4 bedrooms and 3
baths. Three bedrooms on main level with one
on upper level. Upper level bedroom is 24.6 x
16 with ensuite or nursery area 16 x 9.
Storage areas are abundant. Huge wrap
around porches with expansive views of rolling
hillsides and nature. Build completion
projected date is mid October.

Built in 2025

Essential Information

MLS® # 25016266

Price $749,000

Bedrooms 4

Bathrooms 3.00

Full Baths 3

Square Footage 3,474

Acres 5.57



Year Built 2025

Type Residential

Sub-Type Single Family Residence

Style Ranch

Status Active

Community Information

Address 71 Eagle Landing Tract 9

Area 044 - Laurel County

Subdivision Pittsburg Landing

City London

County Laurel

State KY

Zip Code 40741

Amenities

Parking Driveway

# of Garages 3

View Farm, Neighborhood

Interior

Interior Features Dining Area, Ceiling Fan(s), Walk-In Closet(s), Primary First Floor, Bedroom
First Floor, Breakfast Bar

Appliances Dishwasher, Range, Refrigerator, Electric Water Heater

Heating Combination, Heat Pump

Cooling Combination, Heat Pump

Fireplace Yes

Fireplaces Great Room, Propane

Stories One and One Half

Exterior

Lot Description Horses Permitted

Windows Insulated Windows

Roof Dimensional Style

Construction Other

Foundation Block

School Information

District Laurel County - 44



Elementary Johnson Elementary

Middle North Laurel

High North Laurel

Additional Information

Date Listed July 25th, 2025

Listing Details

Listing Office Century 21 Advantage Realty
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